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Note: For additional information, please 
reference the pools information 

package, pool by-law 1620-96, or 
contact building@northdumfries.ca
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Are you installing an above ground 
pool or hot tub?

A lot grading plan is required for
inground and on-ground pools in 

urban settlement areas.

Submit permit application package 
to building@northdumfries.ca

Are you building a deck, pool house 
or any other accessory structures?

Does your property fall under the 
jurisdiction of Source Water 

Protection?

Do you need access to the property 
from the boulevard or road or 

anywhere besides the main 
entrance point?

Have you filled out a permit 
application? 

* Pool permit application form.
* Site plan and construction 
drawings complete with all 
applicable zone and code 
requirements, property lines and 
dimensions.

Are you the homeowner?

An additional permit from the GRCA 
is required

Does your property fall under the 
jurisdiction of the Grand River 

Conservation Authority (GRCA)?

A separate building permit for 
accessory structures is required from 

the Township of North Dumfries.

An additional entrance permit is 
required from the Township of 

North Dumfries.

An additional permit from the GRCA 
is required


